                                          DELINQUENT PROPERTY TAX SALE  
MAP AND PARCEL: T030070225                                                                                       NO BID   
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: ACTION BUILDERS

AMOUNT DUE: $2,524.15  TAX YEARS DUE: 2003-2020  W. RIDGE DRIVE

MAP AND PARCEL: C050290356                                                                 SOLD FOR $520.56
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: ARMOR PROPERTIES INC

AMOUNT DUE: $520.56   TAX YEARS DUE: 2009-2020    DEED BOOK: 1496/340 (PORTION)

HORSELY MILL ROAD

MAP AND PARCEL: 1310229                                                                                          NO BID
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: BAILEY PRESTON

AMOUNT DUE: $14,502.98   TAX YEARS DUE: 2008-2020   . 162 KENNEDY ESTATES

MAP AND PARCEL: 1310231                                                                                         NO BID
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: BAILEY PRESTON

AMOUNT DUE: $3,328.25  TAX YEARS DUE: 2007-2020  44 PRESTON ROAD, CARROLLTON, 

MAP AND PARCEL: 1310232                                                                           SOLD FOR $14,910.63
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: BAILEY PRESTON

AMOUNT DUE: $14,910.63  TAX YEARS DUE: 2012-2020   34 PRESTON RD

MAP AND PARCEL: F050553                                                                               SOLD FOR $687.31    
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: BOODOOSINGH TRICIA

AMOUNT DUE: $687.31  TAX YEARS DUE: 2016-2020  5553 FISHERMAN CT

MAP AND PARCEL: F030123                                                                              SOLD FOR $1,500.00
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: CALLOWAY LILLIE

AMOUNT DUE: $727.31  TAX YEARS DUE: 2016-2020  3123 LAKEVIEW PARKWAY

MAP AND PARCEL: C040040113                                                                        SOLD FOR $499.68        

CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: CARROLL SERVICE & DEV CO

AMOUNT DUE: $499.68  TAX YEARS DUE: 2016-2020

DEED BOOK: 361/641 AND 362/357 (PORTION OF BOTH COMBINED)  OXFORD SQ

MAP AND PARCEL: W020040097                                                                       SOLD FOR $1,950.00
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: COVERSON RAYMOND L

AMOUNT DUE: $1,573.78  TAX YEARS DUE: 2011-2020

DEED BOOK: 3110/284 (PORTION)  WHITE OAK ST

MAP AND PARCEL: W020040098                                                                     SOLD FOR $1,573.78
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: COVERSON RAYMOND L

AMOUNT DUE: $1,573.78  TAX YEARS DUE: 2011-2020

DEED BOOK: 3110/284 (PORTION)  WHITE OAK ST

MAP AND PARCEL: C020150005              NO ROOT DEED                       SOLD FOR  $2,588.19                                                        
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: COX MARION JONES ESTATE AND ALL HEIRS KNOWN AND UNKNOWN     AMOUNT DUE: $2,588.19  TAX YEARS DUE: 2014-2020

DEED BOOK: NOT FOUND  127 KING STREET

MAP AND PARCEL: T030070079                                                                     SOLD FOR $1,815.15
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: CROFT W D SR

AMOUNT DUE: $1,815.15  TAX YEARS DUE: 2011-2020   HOLDER STREET

MAP AND PARCEL: M010020027                                                                    SOLD FOR $1,900.00    
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: GRADY M R MRS

AMOUNT DUE: $365.60  TAX YEARS DUE: 2019-2020  JOE HENDERSON STREET

MAP AND PARCEL: T020110355                                                                      SOLD FOR $2,500.00   
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: GUO CHUNGANG & ZHANG ZHENRONG

AMOUNT DUE: $325.12  TAX YEARS DUE: 2012-2015, 2017-2020  GLENDALE BLVD

MAP AND PARCEL: C080240013                         NO ROOT DEED               NO BID
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: JENNINGS H T ESTATE AND ALL HEIRS KNOWN AND UNKNOWN  AMOUNT DUE: $755.98  TAX YEARS DUE: 2001-2020

DESIGNATED AS MAP AND PARCEL C08 0240013. ALMA STREET

MAP AND PARCEL: V030030003                                                                     SOLD FOR $4,100.00       
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: KEATON JOSEPH W ESTATE AND ALL HEIRS KNOWN AND UNKNOWN   AMOUNT DUE: $585.86  TAX YEARS DUE: 2019-2020  WHITE STREET

MAP AND PARCEL: C030270097                                                                      NO BID
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: LEDBETTER GREGG F

AMOUNT DUE: $1,573.09  TAX YEARS DUE: 2007-2020  105 VALLEY DR

MAP AND PARCEL: 1100074                                                                            NO BID
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: MCDOWELL J G

AMOUNT DUE: $489.79  TAX YEARS DUE: 2016-2020  STERLING ROAD

MAP AND PARCEL: C020180010                                                                    SOLD FOR $1,084.96
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: MICHAEL FABRIKANT & ASSOCIATES

AMOUNT DUE: $1,084.96  TAX YEARS DUE: 2008-2020  114 MOLETTE ST

MAP AND PARCEL: V020050011                                                                   SOLD FOR $2,700.00
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: NEAL B P ESTATE AND ALL HEIRS KNOWN AND UNKNOWN

AMOUNT DUE: $1,866.08  TAX YEARS DUE: 2010-2020  S DOGWOOD ST

MAP AND PARCEL: V030100029                                                                   SOLD FOR $1,830.31            
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: NEESE JAMES D

AMOUNT DUE: $1,830.31  TAX YEARS DUE: 2008-2020  909 FIRST ST

MAP AND PARCEL: C070420310                                                                   SOLD FOR $803.13      
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: OLDE TOWNE DEVELOPMENT BUILDERS LLC

AMOUNT DUE: $803.13  TAX YEARS DUE: 2015-2020

DEED BOOK: 2566/298 (PORTION)   NIZZEAR LANE

MAP AND PARCEL: C070420182                                                                      NO BID                     
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: OLDE TOWNE DEVELOPMENT BUILDERS LLC AND COFFMAN TERRY  M. (VIA TAX DEED)

AMOUNT DUE: $1,077.01  TAX YEARS DUE: 2014-2015, 2017-2020  COTTAGE HILL ROAD

MAP AND PARCEL: F070344                                                                             SOLD FOR $3,700.00
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: PINNACLE FUND LLC

AMOUNT DUE: $865.19  TAX YEARS DUE: 2016-2020  7344 S MITCHELL COURT

MAP AND PARCEL: C050220479                                                                      SOLD FOR $5,962.35
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: PMC THE OAKS LLC

AMOUNT DUE: $5,962.35  TAX YEARS DUE: 2008-2020  141 MILLPOND CROSSING D1

MAP AND PARCEL: C050220484                                                                     SOLD FOR $5,837.35
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: PMC THE OAKS LLC

AMOUNT DUE: $5,837.35  TAX YEARS DUE: 2008-2020

DEED BOOK: 3035/336 (PORTION)  141 MILL POND CROSSSING UNIT D-6

MAP AND PARCEL: 1330031                                                                           SOLD FOR $2,500.00
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: PMR PARTNERS LLC

AMOUNT DUE: $553.77  TAX YEARS DUE: 2017-2020

DEED BOOK: 1194/598 (PORTION)  . 190 KNOB DR

MAP AND PARCEL: C020430348                                                                      NO BID
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: R & B CONSTRUCTION INC

AMOUNT DUE: $662.85  TAX YEARS DUE: 2016-2020

DEED BOOK: 3045/81 (PORTION)   149. TETON AVENUE

MAP AND PARCEL: C020430373                                                                     NO BID 
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: R & B CONSTRUCTION INC

AMOUNT DUE: $3055.58  TAX YEARS DUE: 2012-2020

DEED BOOK: 3045/81 (PORTION)  TETON AVENUE

MAP AND PARCEL: C020340007                                                                    NO BID
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: REDBIRD PROPERTIES INC

AMOUNT DUE: $1,079.44  TAX YEARS DUE: 2010-2020   RIVER DRIVE

MAP AND PARCEL: B040140007                                                                     SOLD FOR $1,024.98
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: SMISSON MARTHA B MRS ESTATE AND ALL HEIRS KNOWN AND UNKNOWN      AMOUNT DUE: $1,024.98  TAX YEARS DUE: 2014-2020  DEED BOOK: 304/58 (PORTION)    BOWDON TYUS RD

MAP AND PARCEL: F020320                                                                            SOLD FOR $3,100.00  
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: SMITHERMAN GLENN A ESTATE AND ALL HEIRS KNOWN AND UNKNOWN    AMOUNT DUE: $837.38  TAX YEARS DUE: 2006-2020  2320 LAKEVIEW PKWY

MAP AND PARCEL: V060040266                                                                     SOLD FOR $1,396.47  
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: SOUTH RIVER ROAD INC

AMOUNT DUE: $1,396.47  TAX YEARS DUE: 2016-2020 DEED BOOK: 4524/240 (PORTION)

403 RIDGEWOOD DRIVE

MAP AND PARCEL: V060040267                                                                      NO BID            
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: SOUTH RIVER ROAD INC

AMOUNT DUE: $1,396.47  TAX YEARS DUE: 2016-2020

DEED BOOK: 4524/240 (PORTION)  405 RIDGEWOOD DRIVE

MAP AND PARCEL: V060040268                                                                   NO BID
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: SOUTH RIVER ROAD INC

AMOUNT DUE: $1,396.47  TAX YEARS DUE: 2016-2020

DEED BOOK: 4524/240 (PORTION)  407 RIDGEWOOD DRIVE 
MAP AND PARCEL: C060200011                                                                 SOLD FOR $837.53
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: SOUTHWOOD CORPORATION

AMOUNT DUE: $837.53  TAX YEARS DUE: 2009-2020

DEED BOOK: 555/456 (PORTION)   ADAMSON AVE

MAP AND PARCEL: 0300238                                                                       SOLD FOR $1,600.00
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: STEPHENS AMOS ESTATE AND ALL HEIRS KNOWN AND UNKNOWN   AMOUNT DUE: $554.25  TAX YEARS DUE: 2018-2020  LEE HUNT ROAD

MAP AND PARCEL: C020440035                                                                SOLD FOR $1,000.00
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: TAYLOR MICHAEL J

AMOUNT DUE: $616.13  TAX YEARS DUE: 2009-2020

DEED BOOK: 637/205 (PORTION)  KINGSBRIDGE DRIVE

MAP AND PARCEL: 0300225                                                                       SOLD FOR $3,700.00
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: TDGA LLC

AMOUNT DUE: $511.92  TAX YEARS DUE: 2016-2020  LAKE CLYDE CIRCLE

MAP AND PARCEL: C020160018                                                                NO BID      
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: THOMAS GOLDEN ESTATE AND THOMAS SAMUEL D III ESTATE TRUSTEE FOR ORVILLE DANIEL TRUST AND ALL HEIRS KNOWN AND UNKNOWN

AMOUNT DUE: $8,316.62  TAX YEARS DUE: 2009-2020  132 MLK JR STREET

MAP AND PARCEL: B020060036                                                                NO BID  
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: THOMAS JOE ANDREW & WILLOUGHBY LAQUITA A ESTATE AND ALL HEIRS KNOWN AND UNKNOWN

AMOUNT DUE: $1,468.40  TAX YEARS DUE: 2006-2020  ANGELA AVENUE

MAP AND PARCEL: F080183                                                                     SOLD FOR $727.31
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: THOMAS VICKIE L & JUANITA

AMOUNT DUE: $727.31  TAX YEARS DUE: 2016-2020  8183 PINEVIEW COURT

MAP AND PARCEL: 1590127                                                                     SOLD FOR $6,000.00      
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: TIARA ENTERPRISES INC & BURTON KELVIN

AMOUNT DUE: $601.90  TAX YEARS DUE: 2019-2020  351 E MILES ROAD

MAP AND PARCEL: C020370124                                                              SOLD FOR $2,500.00
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: TOWNSEND BUDDY

AMOUNT DUE: $1,194.15  TAX YEARS DUE: 2013-2020  316 AVALON DR

MAP AND PARCEL: C080330032                                                              SOLD FOR $5,000.00
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: UNIVERSITY VILLAGE PARTNERS LLC

AMOUNT DUE: $459.04  TAX YEARS DUE: 2011-2020

DEED BOOK: 3477/35 (PORTION)  S OLD HICKORY TRAIL

MAP AND PARCEL: C080330033                                                              SOLD FOR $20,000.00
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: UNIVERSITY VILLAGE PARTNERS LLC

AMOUNT DUE: $459.04  TAX YEARS DUE: 2011-2020  DEED BOOK: 3477/35 (PORTION)

S OLE HICKORY TRAIL

MAP AND PARCEL: T040060153                                                              SOLD FOR $9,752.37      
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: VILLA ROSA ENTERPRISES

AMOUNT DUE: $9,752.37  TAX YEARS DUE: 2007-2020

DEED BOOK: 1342/140 (PORTION)  VILLA ROSA ROAD

MAP AND PARCEL: C080220030                                                             SOLD FOR $4,000.00
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: WATKINS EDWARD

DEFENDANT IN FI-FA: WATKINS LILLIAN - EDWARD WATKINS

AMOUNT DUE: $769.06  TAX YEARS DUE: 2019-2020  728 B ALABAMA ST

MAP AND PARCEL: 1300435                                                                    SOLD FOR $6,500.00
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: WOOD GARRY

AMOUNT DUE: $543.16  TAX YEARS DUE: 2019-2020  140 OAK WOODS DRIVE

MAP AND PARCEL: C050140028                                                              SOLD FOR $1,800.00 
CURRENT RECORD HOLDER: YEARTA NEIL

AMOUNT DUE: $1,600.60  TAX YEARS DUE: 2012-2020  510 WEST AVE

_____________________________________________________________________________________

* Deed Book: Refers to Deed Records located in the Carroll County Courthouse, Clerk of Superior Court's Office where property is more fully described.

